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Course of defence: The student thematized her research and provided her motivations,
showing both the theoretical and empirical that gave rise to her
inquiry. Following that, she defined her research question and
explained how her research strategy would work to address it.
Methodology-wise, the student mentioned she went with a single-
case study, following which she outlined and justified the selection
of her case in terms of relevance and timeliness. Moving on, the
student spoke about her conceptual framework and explained how
they were chosen with the eye to best addressing the puzzle. She also
mentioned existing approaches to the phenomenon and explained
that she chose a different approach to ensure that her work had an
added value. That being explored, the student moved to describe her
findings in rich empirical detail, with recourse also to normative
considerations. Coming to the reviews, the student disputed one
reviewer's comment as its critique was not directly relevant to the
topic of her research, esp. in relation to the question of conflict. She
also spoke about her theoretical framework and defended her
choices. The student then asked the committee if her grade could be
reconsidered, but the committee explained that it was not within the
scope of their competence. One committee member also explained
that an author is never happy with reviews. The student then asked if
there could a third reviewer brought in. The committee explained that
it has happened but probably was not applicable to this case. Instead,
however, the committee suggested that the student tried to refine her
work and the get it published, as that was of greater importance in
the end. Another committee member praised the work. The third
member then asked the student about policy recommendations. The
student said that she had not formulated them explicitly but
suggested ways that she thought should be taken.
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Result of defence: excellent (B)
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