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Course of defence: The student began by thematizing and contextualizing his topic and
outlined his motivation for his interest also in personal terms. Then,
he went on to present his research questions, one of which was more
policy-oriented and the student provided some explanations for his
choice. Moving on to his research strategy, the student spend a few
whiles speaking about his methodology and the data sources he
worked with, many of which were primary ones, such as primary
documents or archival sources. Methodology-wise, the student
combined both quantitive and qualitative approaches. Before
speaking about his findings, the student clarified some of his
concepts. Getting to the findings themselves, the student
synthetically provided answers to his research questions that cut
across, and were derived from, his diverse methods. Based on the
findings, the student offered his conclusions and showed linkages
between his findings and wider empirical-theoretical issues. Turning
to reviews, one comment suggested that the work needed to include a
specific theoretical framework to better integrate his concepts, but
the student disputed this and used examples from his thesis to
support his claim. The committee asked if there was a contribution
that the work made in relation to any wider universe. The student
drew a connection between his work and a theoretical lacuna, one
that could also be policy-relevant. One committee member wanted to
know more about some of the policy recommendations the student
could offer to the problems he identified in his work. The student
answered to the satisfaction of the committee member. Another
member lauded the thesis and wanted to know if the student had
drawn on the literature on conflict and development as that could be
beneficial. The student answered negatively but agreed that his work
would benefit from doing so and hinted that he was planning to delve
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into the area in his future research.

Result of defence: excellent (A)
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